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CERTIFICATION AND SIGNATURE PAGE 

By signing below. or submitting documentation through the West Virginia Vendor Self Service 
Portal website, I certify that I have reviewed this Solicitation in its entirety; that I understand the 
requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained herein; that this bid, off~ or 
proposal constitutes an offer to the State that·cannot be unilatcrally withdrawn; that the product or 
service proposed meets the mandatory requirements contained in the Solicitation for that product 
or service, unless otherwise stated herein; that the Vendor accepts the terms and conditions 
contained in the Solicitation, unless otherwise stated herein; that I am submitting this bid, offer or 
proposal for review and consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute and submit 
this bid, offer. or proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor's behalf; that I am 
authorized to bind the vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge, 
the vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may require registration. 

Russell Standard Corp. 

~ 
(Print or Type Name and Title 
of Signatory) 
(412) 449-0700 

(Phone Number) 

(412) 449-0704 
(Fax Number) 

david.obyc®russellstandard.com 
(Email address) 

21-Feb-17 
(Date) 

Form pre-approved by DOH legal divfdon on July 12, 2016. 
Attomey &lgnature not required. 

14 



! . 
I 

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM 
SOLICITATION NO.:DOT1700000014 

Instructions: Please acknowledge receipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by 
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum 
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification. 

Acknowledgment. I hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the 
necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc. 

Addendum Numbers Received: 
(Check the box next to each addendum received) 

[!Addendum No. 1 D AddeDdum No.6 

D Addendum No.2 0 Addendum No. 7 

D Addendum No. 3 D Addendum No. 8 
.. · .. 

0 Addendum No. 4 0 .Adde:Ddum No. 9 

0 Addendum No. 5 0 Addendum No. tO 

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid. I 
further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during Bliy oral 
discussion held between Vendor's representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only the 
infonnation issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is binding. 

Russell Standard Corporation 
Full Company Name 

David P. Ob c 

21-Feb-17 
Date 

NOTE: This addendum. acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite 
document processing. 
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INFORMATION ATTACHMENT 
SURFACE TREATMENT 

Vendor's Equipment Storage Location 
VENDOR NAME Russell Standard Corporation 

Mandatory- Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission. 

The Vendor shall provide the 911 address or the most recent physical street address, city and state, for the 
Equipment Storage Location. The Vendor may provide additional Equipment Storage Locations, if applicable. 
The Vendor shall identify the District(s) being serviced by each Equipment Storage Location. 

If the Vendor fails to provide the Equipment Storage Location information, the Vendor's bid will be disqualified 

in its entirety. 

Vendor's Equipment Storage Location: RSC Mars Operations Center 

Russell Standard Corp. District(s) Dist 3 

171 Seventh Ave. Serviced: Dist 4 
Valencia, PA 16059 Dist 6 

Dist 7 

Vendor's Equipment Storage Location: HEL Fayetteville Operations Center 

Hammaker East Limited District(s) Dist 5 
1514 Black Gap Road Serviced: Dist 7 
Fayetteville, PA 17222 Dist 8 

Vendor's Equipment Storage Location: 

District( s) 
Serviced: 

Vendor's Equipment Storage Location: 

District(s) 
Serviced: 

Vendor may duplicate this page if additional space is needed for additional Equipment Storage Locations. 
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RUSSELL STANDARD CORP . 
General Contractors 
Manufacturers of Asphalt 
Materials. Emulsions and Coatings 
Since 1929 

Certificate of Secretary 
As to 

Corporate Resolution 

285 Kappa Drive. Suite 300 
Pittsburgh. PA 15238 . 
(412) 449-0700 
(412) 449-0704 Fax 

I, George Leach, Secretary of Russell Standard Corporation, a Corporation 
organized under the laws of the state of Pennsylvania, do hereby certify that the 
following resolution is a full, true and correct copy of a resolution of the Board of 
Directors of said Corporation, duly and regularly adopted by the Board of 
Directors in confonnance with applicable law and the by-laws of said Corporation 
on the 3rd day of February, 2014. 

Resolved that: 

David Obyc, Chief Estimator 

Is hereby authorized and directed to sign bid documents on behalf of the Corporation, and 
bind the Corporation to the terms of such bid documents that may apply to the 
procurement and execution of construction work and related activities. 

I further certify that said resolution has not been amended or revoked and is still in full 
force and effect. 

In witness whereof, I have hereunto set my name as Secretary and affixed the seal of said 
Corporation, this 3rd day ofFebruary, 2014. 

An Equal Opportunity Employer through Affirmative Action 
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0173000150757 1-Al Pumell Standard Corp. NIA 1-A1 02 Sidese Single Ywd. St No Bid 5 N/A N/A NIA NIA N/A WA N/A NIA 

000000155757 t-A2 Russel Standard Corp WA 1-82 7315102 Sufic* Inter, Services Olatist 1. Surface Treetment Type B Single - 25.001 - 75.000 yard* St No Bid 5 N/A N/A NIA NIA N/A NIA NIA NIA 

000000159757 140 Russel Standard Com. NIA 1-A3 7303102 Surface imammiServlees 010141 1 - Burin Treabnent Type 6 Str0le • 78.031 rants and sneer St No Bid 5 NIA N/A WA NIA N/A NIA N/A NIA 

000000159757 1-AA %Mee MMUS Cana NIA 1-A4 73 8 02 &date Treetmen1 Sento, Markt 1 • Surclwrgs for Paoli. monad Omionk Embified As- Type 13 Shy.* St No Bid 5 N/A N/A NIA NIA N/A WA N/A WA 

000050159757 1411 Rineefl Standard Coro. NIA 1-61 >315102 &dace Trammel Se-Aces Ofstrld 1 - Surface Treatment Type C Double .0- 25.0:0 yards St NO Bid 5 N/A N/A WA N/A N/A WA N/A WA 

0000110159757 1412 Fbemall Stmelerd Corp NIA 142 7310102 Stria. treatmens Sante* Ciatict 1 - Surface Treatment TWO C Owl* - 25.001.15.003 yenta St No Bid 5 N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A WA N/A NIA 

000000159757 1433 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 1-e3 7315102 Sept 	Treatment SerAcea. Diabk1 1 - Surface Tenthly& Type C Double -75.001 yards and greeter St NO Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA 

C00900150757 1434 Rune Manderd Corp. NIA 141* 7310102 Surtace Treelme.n1 unison Ellalrld 1 . Sunlurge for Polymer Modified Cabal* Emulsified Mellen. Tyro C Mode St NO Bid 5 N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A WA N/A NIA 

100000150757 141 Runes Starclard Cap. NIA 141 7310102 &ewe To oatmeal Semites Dastrla 1. Solace Treatment Type I) Ttiole - 0 - 25.000 yards St No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A WA 

000000150757 142 Rusee0 Steralard Corp. WA 142 7310102 sst Me 	 Yrd . St No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A WA 

000000150757 143 Russell Stimelard Coop. NIA 1-C3 7315102 Deface Treatment Sates Dtabicl 1- Surface men.* 	rip.. 	yenta and greater . St ND Bid 5 WA N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A WA 

000200150757 144 Rase Swami, COW. NIA 1-04 7318102 Surface TrearneM Barden DistIcl I • Surtherge for Polymer Madified Ceticeic EMuldied Alpha*. Type 0 Triple St No Bid 5 N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

003000150757 1.01 Ruses§ Standen! Corp. NIA 1-01 7318102 Striate Treatment SeMcea DistrIsl 1 - Fog Sai• 0-25.000 yeses St NO Bid 5 N/A NIA WA N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A 

000300152757 142 Rune. Standard Com. NIA 1-02 7318102 Data TteMmerrt Service* District I. Fog Seel - 25.001 to ?DOW yards St No Bid 5 N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A r4//‘ 

000330159757 1-03 Rune. Standard Corp. WA 1.03 7318102 Surface TeteMienl Service* DIttr/C1 1 . Fog Se./- 75.001 yards end promo St No Bid 5 NIA N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000:001505/ 141 Russell Standard Corp. NM 141 02 SAS= menet Seabee DIstrict 1- Mental!. Traffic -1310. Truck .050410w Day No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A 

000:03159757 142 Russel Standard Coop. NM 142 7315102 Surface Treetment San.= Paola 1 • IMIntsiing intdo - Tref& Googol Devices UNIT No Bid 5 N/A WA N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A WA 

000%0150757 143 Russell Stanciod Cap- N/A 143 7318102 Surface 'freemen &wk., District I. Ataintaking Traffic • Flogger HOUR NO Bid 5 N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA 

000000150757 1-E4 Rune. Standard Corp. 14/A 14.1 7310102 &dee Treatment Se's/pet 00/pod/I- MagrealnIng T 	Arrow Dowd Day NO Bid 5 NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A WA N/A WA 

000000159757 -F Ruyan Standard Corp. N/A 1+1 7315102 Surfs. TroMmern Sentes Patric( 1 • MatdirsOon loo as to. MILE No Bid 5 NIA NIA WA N/A N/A N/A WA WA 

000003150757 1-F2 Rome. Stendatd COM. N/A 142 7315102 5's/ace Trestmerd Barden Ellalskl. 1 - lAotglzation Ice each AddlOormi We after Ow Soot nee MILE No Bid 5 N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A WA 

imoopoisoist 1-01 Russell Staralard Corp. N/A 1.01 7315102 Sudsy.* Treatment Unice* 00s1501 • Aggreysie timallry SLIthiege - Doane Ca.* TON No Bid 5 NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A WA 

000200150757 -02 Russel Standard Coop. N/A 1-02 7318102 Swine Treatment Se-toe District 1- Aggregate Nadir° Sun:herr • Oey CeemlY TON NO Bld 5 N/A N/A WA N/A N/A WA N/A N/A 

000000150757 143 Russel Standard Corp. NM 143 7318102 Striate TreaMerd &melees Dlablet 1. Aggregate Hauling Smtharge • Kanamhe County TON NO Bid 5 NIA N/A WA N/A N/A WA N/A N/A 

000000150757 144 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 1.04 7310102 Surface Trewment Seneces District I- Aggregate Hauling Serene - Melon Geo,* TON NO Bid 5 NIA NIA NIA NIA NIA N/A N/A WA 

000000150757 145 Ronal Slanlart Corp. WA  1435  /SHIM Data TreeMweat Services Medal - A0750410  Hauling Sondwrge • cutrom datiO TON No Bid 5 N/A WA NIA N/A NIA N/A N/A WA 
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000000150757 2-Al Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-Al 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Surface Treatment. Type B Single -0-21500 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-A2 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-A2 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Surface Treathent Type B Single • 25,001 - 75.000 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-A3 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-A3 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Surface Treabnent, Type B Single - 75.001 yards and greater SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-A4 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-A4 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2 - Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt - Type B Single SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000151757 2-B1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-B1 7318102 Stniace Treatment Services District 2 • Surface Treatment. Type C Double - 0 • 20.300 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A WA 

000000150757 2•32 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-02 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2 - Surface Treatment, Type C Double -25,001-75.000 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2133 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-83 7318102 Surface Treatment Services Disbrat 2- Surface Treatment, Type C Double - 75,001 yards and greater SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A WA.  WA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-04 Russell Standard Com, N/A 2-04 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type C Double SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-C1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-C1 7318102 Sudace Treatment Services 0/us/cIa- Surface Treatment. Type 0 Triple -0-25.000 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 2-C2 Russell Standard Corp, N/A 2-C2 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2. Surface Trealment•  Type D Triple .20.331 to 75,000 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-C3 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-Cl 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Surface Treatment. Type D Triple - 75.001 yards and greater SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-00 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-C4 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2. Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt Type D Triple SY No Bid 5 WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-01 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-01 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2 - Fag Seal - 0 - 25.000 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-02 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2 - Fog Seal. 25,001 to 75,000 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-03 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-03 7318102 Surface Treatment Services Disffict 2- Fog Seal - 75,001 yards and greater SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-01 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-E1 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2 - Maintaining Traffic- Pilot Truck and Driver Day No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-02 Russell Standard Corp. NIA 2-02 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Maintaining Traffic. Traffic Control Devices UNIT No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-E3 Russell Standard COrp. N/A 2-03 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2 - MaIntalning Traffic - Flagger HOUR No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-E4 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-04 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board Day No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-F1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-F1 7310102 Surface Treatment Services District 2. Mobilization for First Mile MILE No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-F2 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-F2 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Mobilization for each Additional Mile alter the first mile MILE No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000152757 2-G1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-01 73113102 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - °obeli Count. TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2•02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 2-02 7918102 Surface Treatment Services District 2 - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Lincoln County TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-03 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-03 7318102 Surface Treatment Service. District 2. Aggregate Hauling Surcharge -Logan COUntY TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-3I Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-04 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Mingo County TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 2-05 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 2-05 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 2' Aggregate Hauling Surcharge- Wayne CoUnlY TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
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000000150757 3-Al Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-Al 7318102 Surface Treatrnent Services Distict 3- Surface Treaenent. Type B Single - 0 - 25,000 yards SY $1.650 5 N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 3-A2 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-A2 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 3- Surface Treatment, Type B Single -25,001-78,000 yards SY $1.550 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 3-A3 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-A3 7318102 Surhice Treatment Services District 3. surface Treahnent Type B Single - 75.001 yards and greater SY $1400 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 3-Ad Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3.0.4 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 3- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt- Type B Single SY $0.100 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 3-B1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-81 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Surface Treatment, Type C Double - 0 - 25.000 yards SY $3.100 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 3-192 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-02 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Surface Treatment, Type C Double - 25,001 - 70.000 yards SY $2.900 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 3-133 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-53 7318102 Surface Treatreent Services District 3 - Surface Treatment type C Double -75,001 yards and greater SY $2.750 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 3-B4 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-Sc 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 3- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type C Double SY $0200 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 3-C1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-C1 7318102 Surface Trealinent Services District 2- Surface Treatment, Type D Triple -0. 25.000 yards. SY $4.800 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 3-02 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-C2 7918102 Surface Treatment Services District 3- Surface Treatment. Type D Triple -28,001 to 75,000 yards SY $4.500 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 3-C3 Russell Standard Corp N/A 3-03 7318102 Surface Treabnent Services District 3- Surface Treatment, Type D Tnple - 75,001 yards and greater SY $4.350 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 9-00 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 9-00 7918102 Surface Treatrnent Services District 3- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt. Type 0 TLple SY $0.350 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 3-D1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-01 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Fog Seal - 0 - 25.000 yards SY $1.100 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 3-D2 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-D2 7318102 Surface Treatment Sonic. District 3 - Fog Seal- 25,001 Sc 75.000 yards SY $1.100 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 3-D3 Russell Standard corp. N/A 3-D3 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 3-rug Seal - 75,001 yards and MOMS SY $1.100 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 

000000150757 9-E1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-E1 7318102 Surface Treatrnent Services District 3' Maintaining Trail' 	Pilot Truck and Driver Day 61.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 3-02 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-02 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 3 - Maintaining Tra 	Traffic Control Devices UNIT $0.500 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 3-03 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-03 7918102 Surface Treatment Senices District 3. Maintaining Traffic - Flagger HOUR $75.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000158757 3'E4 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-E4 7318102 Surface TreatMent Services District 3 - Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board Day $50.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 

000000155757 0-F1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-F1 7318102 Surface Treatment Senecas District 0- Mobilization for First Mile MILE $500.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 3-F2 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-F2 7318102 Surface Treatment Services DIshict 3. Mobilization for each AddiOonal Mile after the first mile MILE $49.950 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 0-01 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-01 7318102 Suring Treatment Services District 3- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge . Calhoun Count./ TON $20.750 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 3-02 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-02 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 3- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - lasisoar County TON $21.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

00000015E4757 3-03 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3.03 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 3- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Pleasants County TON $8.500 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 3-00 Rumen Standard Corp N/A 3-04 7315102 Surface Treabnent Services District 3- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Ritchie County TON $13.250 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 3-G5 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-05 7318102 Surface Treatment Services Distrkt 3- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Roane County TON $29750 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
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000000159757 3-08 Russell Standard Carp. N/A 3-.00 7318102 Surface Treatment Services Dishict 3- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge -Wid County TON $17.250 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 3-07 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 3-07 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 3 	gregate Hauling S 	rge 	ood County TON $15.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 4-A1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4-A1 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4- Surface Treatment, Type B Single -0-25,301 yards SY $1.245 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 432 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4-A2 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Surface Treatment Type B Sing/. - 25,001 - 75.000 yards SY $1.165 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 4-A3 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4-A3 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Surface Treatment Type B Single - 75,001 yards and greater SY $1040 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 4-A4 Russell standard Corp. N/A 4-A4 7318102 Surface Treatment Services DistriW 4- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt - Type B Single SY $0.110 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000003150757 4-B1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4-51 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4' Surface Treatment Type C Double -0-25.000 yards SY $2.380 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

330000159757 4-52 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4-52 7318102 Surface Treatment Se 	es District 4 - Surface Treatrnent, Type C Double - 25.001 -75,000 yards SY $2.190 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

330000159757 4413 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 443 73/8102 Surface Treahrent Services District 4- Surface Treatment. Type C Double - 75.001 yards end greater SY $2.070 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

330000151757 4434 Russell Standard Cony. N/A 4-54 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt Type C Double SY $0.175 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 4-Ct Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4-C1 7918102 Surface Treahment Services Distict 4 - Surface Treatment Type D Triple - 0 - 25,000 yards SY $3.570 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000158757 4-0.2 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-C2 7318102 Sudace Treatment Services District 4- Surface Treahnent Type 0 Triple - 25,001 to 75,000 yards SY $3.345 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A 

003330150757 4-C3 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4-C3 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4 • Surface Treatment Type ID Triple -75,001 yards cod greater SY $3.225 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 4-C4 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4-C4 7318102 Surface Treatment Sanices District 4- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type D Triple SY $0.280 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

003030159757 4-01 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4-01 7318102 Surface Treafineet Services District 4- Fog Seal - 0 - 25.300 yards SY $0.850 5 WA WA WA WA WA WA WA WA 

000000159757 4-02 Russell Standard Corp. NIA 4-02 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Fog Seal - 25.031 to 75,000 yards SY $0800 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 4-113 Russell standard Corp. N/A 4-03 7918102 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Fog Seal - 75.001 yards end greater SY $0750 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000154757 4E1 Russell standard Corp. N/A 4-E1 7918102 Surface Treatment Services DIstrIct 4 - Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver Day $1.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000003150757 4-E2 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4-52 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4- Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices UNIT $0.300 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 4-13 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4-E3 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Maintaining Traffic - Flogger HOUR $55.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 4-54 Russell Standard Cord N/A 4-E4 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4- Maintain 	Traffic - Arrow  Board Day $20.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000003150757 4-F1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4-51 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4- Mobilization for First mile MILE $500.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 4-F2 Russell Standard Corp. WA 4-F2 7318102 Surface Treafinent Services District 4- Mobilization for each Additional Mile after the first mile MILE $49.950 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000003159757 4-01 Russell standard Corp. NIA 4-01 7316102 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Aggregate Ita 	Surcharge- Doddridge County TON $18.250 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

0000001591757 4-02 Russell Standard Corp N/A 4-02 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Her 	County TON $12.600 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 4-03 Russell Smndard Cord N/A 4-03 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 4 - Aggregate Hauling surcharge - merit., County TON $10.450 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
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000000150757 4434 Rumen Slanetrd Com, NIA 404 7310102 Sulam Treatment Sanaa DistrIO 4 - A0gralmlo Haulm Stschrtma • Mononglein Canty TON 54.650 5 NIA NIA NIA N/A NIA NIA N/A NIA 

030CC0150757 4-05 Rune@ Slandard Corp. NIA 4415 7318102 &trace Trestment Santee DistIM 4 - /wept Hauling Surchana. • Patton County TON 57.000 5 WA N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A NIA 

408 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 4438 7318102 Stews Treatment Santee 000000150757 

 

015108 4. enter* liauMm Surcharge . Tenor County TON $11400 5 NIA NIA NIA N/A N/A WA WA N/A 

000030150757 Sal Rum% Etlendard Ca". NIA .5.-Al 7318102 &ewe Treatment Santee. 01114 5- Sunoco ire/nowt Type 8 WON. 0 . 25.000 yens SY $1.550 5 NIA N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 5-A2 Rune. Slandwd Cap, N/A SA? 7318102 Surface Trate-era Santos* Ostia 5 - Stems Treatment Type 8 Sinale -15,001 .70.000 yenta SY $1460 5 NIA NIA NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

CO0000150757 5-A3 Russell Standard Corp. NIA 5-A3 73115102 &Mace Treatment Services 0141015.• Surface Treatment type El Single • 75.001 yards end greaten SY 51.300 5 N/A N/A NIA N/A NIA NIA NIA NIA 

L01100015075? SA4 Russel Standard Cap N/A 5-AA 7319102 Stems Tnesboard &Mom Dinticl S. 	 Inalnad Cabaret Emulsified Asphall • Type 8 SIngle SY $0.120 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A NIA 

000000150757 5-01 Russell Standard Corp. NIA SEM 7318102 Surface Treatment Sonia, 0(1414 5. Su,/.coTrnbp.nl. Type C DouNts -0- 25.000 yen,* SY $2.950 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A NIA 

000000150757 5412 Russe851anden1 Gone N/A 5432 7318102 Suring 'Imolai. Sera. 0,4008 5. Surface instinct Type C Double - 25,001 . 75.0IX) yards SY 52.730 5 N/A WA WA WA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

583 Russell Steeted Corp. N/A 5413 7310502 Sodom Tmetment Servlats 000000150757 

 

Maid S. Strtme reaboonl. 	Double 	meets erd grab/ . SY $2.580 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A 

000000150757 5-04 Russ.. Steads-LI Corp. N/A 584 7318102 Surface 'remanent Samba Minn 5. Surcharge Mr Polymer Modified Work Erridaded AsplialL Tn. C Double SY 50.220 5 N/A N/A WA NIA NIA WA NIA NIA 

000000150757 5-01 Russel/ Slaretettl Grp. N/A 5-01 7318102 Sudeze Treelment Sat., Meld 5. Surface Treatment Type 0 Tplale -0 - 25.800 yards SY $4.450 5 N/A WA N/A NIA NIA WA N/A N/A 

C00000150757 . 5-02 Rumen Menem" Gap. N/A 5-02 73113102 56,0.0e Trainer/1So*. 0.01:15 - Surface Immanent. Type 0 Triple . 25,001 1175.000 sands SY $4.180 5 N/A WA NIA NIA N/A NIA NIA N/A 

000000150757 5-03 Rasta Standard Can N/A 5-03 7318102 Sullos Treelnwri Stotts* PatIct 5. Surface nestranl ype 	rIple 	yards end greater SY 54.050 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A NIA NIA NIA 

000000150757 5-04 Russel Standard Ca m NIA 544 7318102 Surface Treatment Serapes Cabin 5 Surchame kr Polymer Moiled Wank Emulsified Asphalt Tap 0 Triple SY $0.360 5 N/A WA NIA N/A WA N/A N/A WA 

003000150757 5431 Rune Stretdard Corp. NIA 5-01 7318102 Sodom Trmtrient Santee CM:6M 5. Fog Seal - 0 - 25.303 yerds SY $0.850 5 N/A WA NIA NIA NIA WA NIA N/A 

003000150757 5432 Russet Sbindard Corp. N/A SO2 7318102 Surface Traetterent Senates Ott 5- Fog Sal - 25.001 to 75.000 node SY $0.800 5 N/A WA N/A N/A WA N/A NIA WA 

000000150/57 5433 Rosette Smelled Carla N/A 5433 7310102 ' 	 • 	Maas 	petier SY 50.750 5 N/A WA NIA N/A WA N/A NIA NIA 

3-E1 Renee Stemlerd Cam. N/A 5-E1 7318102 Statos Trestles-a Sonia, aw000ntrai 

 

Diann 5 • lAatmairena Trek • Not Truck and Odwv Day 51.000 5 N/A NIA NIA N/A N/A NIA WA NIA 

300000150157 5E2 Russell Stretched Corp. N/A 7318102 Sodom TreatmettSorsices Mein 5 • Mebiterin0 Traffic .. Traffic Control Nikes UNIT $0.300 5 N/A N/A WA N/A WA N/A N/A WA 

000000150757 5-E3 Russell Slanderd Germ N/A 5-E3 7318102 &Oa Treenail Santa Olmen 5 - etsa8elein0 Trete - Flexor HOUR 555.030 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A 

C00000150757 5-E4 Russel Standerd Cam NIA SEA 7318102 Surfoos Tronmem Sonora Male 5 .144.1ntaing 'Mork • Anon Board Day $20.000 5 N/A N/A WA N/A WA WA N/A NIA 

000000150757 5.$1 Russel amend COM. N/A 5-51 7318102 Sudne Trerttnerrl SernIcae Mehl 0- MobBlnion For Etre Mae NILE 5500.000 5 N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 S.F2 Russell 54e40ard Corn NM 5-F2 1310102 Suers Treatment Services 0E51.1 5.• Motion br each Arldlbonal Woes OPII illl SS MILE $49.950 5 N/A N/A NIA N/A NIA NIA WA WA 

000000150757 5431 Rateell Standard Cap. NIA 5-01 73 8 02 Sten Treatment &antes Dieelc15 - ALEiregate titular; Surcharge -.13erteley ComtlY TON 542.500 5 N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A WA NIA NIA 

C00000150757 5-02 Russell &indeed Corp. NIA 5432 7318102 Sufism Treatment Semites 0140108 5 - Aggregate Haim 5.Lesherge • Oren Ca4117 TON $19.500 5 N/A N/A WA N/A N/A NIA WA NIA 
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000E00150757 5-03 Rneell Starrlad Cap. NIA 5.03 7310102 Swine TMOTIlifit Services Ikabicl 5. Awfregata Haullro Surcharge • 'lamps/ire Costly TON 18750 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A WA N/A 

000003150757 SO4 Rosati Starched On N/A 5-04 7310102 &din Treatment Senecas 13101,4 5. Aggregate Hauling SLettlyn - Kern Canty TON $15.750 5 NIA NIA N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A 

900300150757 5-05 Rune Standard Corp, NIA 5.05 7310102 Surf.. Treatment Union Diana 5- Anne% mowing Stachrge • legman entity TON 543.250 5 N/A NIA NIA NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150751 SOO Russell stindard Cam. N/A 5-08 7310102 Surface Trestment Senfees Mend 5. Agrente Haulm Sinn., -1400e04 Cowry TON $8.003 5 N/A N/A NIA NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 5437 Rune Mended Corp. WA 5.07 7310102  Surface Tenement SeMces Nand 5 - Inegne HeulIng Surharge - Macon Count/ TON $37.030 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

93000015075? SA1 Runnel Standen Cap. WA fgAl 7318102 Surface Treatment &mien 00091016 - Sudan if estnefet. Type B Simla -0-25.000 yards St 51.385 5 NIA WA N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A 

E00000159757 0-A2 N/A 0-82 7318102 Salute Treatment Services Rune% Steed 

 

Coop. Menet 0 • Surface Trainmen, Twe El Shgle • 25,001 -75,000 reds St $1.305 5 NIA NIA N/A NIA NIA N/A WA N/A 

000000159757 0-Al Rm.. Ellanderd Corp. N/A 0A3 7310102 Suffice Tennant Seine Markt 6- Surface Treetment, Type 13 Shale • 75001 yang@ end green St $1.165 5 N/A NIA N/A NIA N/A NIA N/A N/A 

000000150757 044 Russel Mandell Carp, N/A 0-A4 7318102 Surface Treat/tem Seneces POW 0 - Sutccene fee P47100 lAcdfled Calienk EmulaMed Asphalt • Type 13 51/01. St $0.110 5 N/A NIA NIA WA WA N/A NIA N/A 

0E0000159757 0-131 RN...Standard Corp, WA 0.431 7318102 Surface Treatment Service. Matti 0- Enlace Tenement Type C Double , 0 , 25.000 St $2.675 5 N/A WA N/A NIA NIA N/A WA WA 

C03000150757 0-02 Russel Standard Cap. WA 082 7318102 Surface Treatment Senices Diniet 6 - Stefan Treatment Tyre C Dote • 20.1301 .75.000 yards St 52.475 5 N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 

00%00150757 683 Rasa Standee! COM- N/A e433 7318102 Suers Treatment Union Dint a r Such.  Treason Two C Owlee -75.001 yards end green St 32.345 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

00E900159757 604 Russel Starclard Coop. N/A 0434 7318102 Sutme Treatment Seines Mend 8 , Surcharge for Polymer 1.1001e4 Cedric &NAAS Intfall. Type C Dingle St 50.180 5 N/A WA N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000003150757 6-C1 Rune. Standafd Cop, WA 0-C1 7310102 Scene Treemnt Services Pak! 0 - Scrface Tr11•01M111. Ty,. D Teple . 0 -25000 yards St 54.085 5 N/A WA N/A WA WA N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 8-C2 Rifled Slanclad Corp. NIA 0-C2 7318102 Surface Treatment Sonless E15tele10 . Surface Treatment, Two D TrfpM - 15.00100 7500) yang St 53.825 5 N/A WA N/A WA NIA NIA WA NIA 

0000N150757 0-03 Rend Standafd Corp N/A 0-03 7318102 &en Treatment SerAcee District a • Surface Treatment Tyro 0144. - 75.001 garde end pinta St $3.695 5 WA WA N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A WA 

000000150757 6-C4 %SUM Mandate Corp_ WA 0-04 7318102 Suffen Treatment SersIon District 0 . Sunhats* fee Petymer Meefftled Connie Emulsified Asphalt. Type 0 Tftle St $0.290 5 N/A WA N/A WA N/A N/A NIA NIA 

000030150757 0-01 Rune. Standen] COM. NIA 0-01 7318102 SYNC. Trgezient Senlc.e Distict G. Feg Seat,  0 . 25,000 pods St 50.850 5 N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A NIA NIA 

000E00150757 603 Rune. Standard Carp WA 002 7318102 Gtelace Treatment Semites 01151016 - Fag Seat,  25.00100 75000 yarn St $0.800 5 N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A NIA N/A 

000000159757 6-03 Ruud Standard Cap. N/A 003 7318102 Swine Tenement Services Disticie . Fog Seat. 75.001 yens as greeter St 50.750 5 N/A NIA NIA NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000:03150757 0E1 Rung Standard Coro. N/A III-E1 73 8 02 Surface Treatment Services 0irtrle1 If . Mairniring Trete - Filet Truck and Drher MW $1.000 5 WA WA WA WA WA WA WA WA 

000000150757 602 Rune/1 Stendafg Cop, NM 0E2 7310102 Swine Tfeenent Slembes pima a • MentsiSna Trek • Trek Control Mulcts UNIT $0.300 5 N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A WA WA 

000:00150757 4-E3 Ruses. Sfandefd Corp. WA 0-E3 7318102 Strfaciareetment Services Pale el • itterniring Trot/a- Mawr HOUR $55.000 5 N/A NIA N/A NIA NIA NIA WA N/A 

000000159757 6-E4 Rona Stendard Corp. N/A 0-E4 7318102 Surface 	Seerkes roffic Day 520.000. 5 WA NIA N/A WA N/A WA N/A N/A 

000:00159757 041 Russell Stanctoo Corp. WA 041 7310002 Stefan Treat:10s States Dierlel El • igabliznon Ice P00.1 1400 MILE $500.000 5 N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A WA N/A 

000:03150757 042 Nunn Standard Corp. NIA 0-F2 7318102 Suing Treatment Senecas pinkie • Mobilhatbon tor mkt Addlbonel ILI. after the Sr.. ri.Me MILE 549950 5 N/A N/A N/A WA NIA N/A WA WA 
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000000150757 0431 Pulse Standard Corp. N/A 8.01 7318002 Surface Treene &ekes Pee 6 . Aggregale HeuRro &edema . Brooke County TON $10660 5 NIA WA NIA N/A NIA N/A NIA N/A 

000300150757 0-02 Ruaaee Siete Oe, N/A 8.02 02 &ewe reanneni Benet Delet 0 . A00004% Hauling Sotheme • Hancock Came! TON $14.150 5 NIA WA NIA N/A WA NIA N/A N/A 

30W00150757 0-03 Rune, Stelard Corp N/A 0-03 7318102 Surfed Treeeal Santo Easel 0 - AewegaIe Hauling Surchee - Menfol CcelY TON $5950 5 NIA NIA NIA N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA 

300030150757 0-04 Outten sunthe Coro N/A 0434 7318102 Sof 	reatme Seipp Mettle .ftepeogo. Hadley Surcherge • 0/14 County TON $6,600 5 N/A N/A NIA NIA WA N/A N/A WA 

M0000150757 0-05 %well Standard Corp. N/A 6435 7310102 Surface Truett Seeley Dialed .3 • Apgrepele Meng. Suchen?, - lyer County TON $16.050 5 NIA N/A NIA N/A N/A NIA N/A NIA 

730000150757 0.08 Rouen Ste/el Corp. N/A 0430 7318802 Surface 7 	Union Dlekt 0 - AOtpeOltle Ilsolln0 Seethes. . Wetzel COI* TON $8.150 5 WA WA N/A NIA WA NIA N/A NIA 

000000150757 7.A1 Ruwell Menthe Corp. N/A 7.A1 7310102 Surface Treatred Santos Nadel 7. Surfeee Tmenent. Type B Sin*-0-25,000 verde. SY $1450 5 NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A WA 

CO0000150757 7.A2 Rouen Stride Corp N/A 742 7318102 Sulam Treatment Babes DIstid 7- Seco Treatment Typo B Single - 25.031 - 75X00 re. SY $1.335 5 N/A N/A WA N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A 

C00000159757 7.A3 Russell Stantel Cap WA 7.A3 7380102 &ea Treatment Sank. Easel 7. Surface Textual. Tyre B Simla .75.001 yards and greater SY $1.195 5 N/A N/A N/A WA N/A WA WA N/A 

D00000159757 7-A4 Ruesed1 Stetted Corp. WA 7•A4 7310102 Surface Treatment &Saes DEMO 7- Surclorge for Pelynna ModEed Ce0onle P.aettred Asphalt - Type 0 Single SY $0.125 5 NIA NIA N/A WA NIA NIA WA N/A 

CO3000150757 7.01 Rosen Standard Corp N/A 7-511 7318102 Surface Treatment Senecta MAIO 7- Solace Treatment Type C Double .0. 25030 mos SY $2.725 5 N/A N/A WA N/A N/A WA N/A N/A 

CO0000150757 7432 Button Standard Corp. WA 7432 73113102 50.-face TN:ewe Unice* 051510 7- Surface Treatment bps C Double -25,001- 75.0O3 orda SY $2.485 5 N/A N/A NIA WA N/A N/A N/A NIA 

000000150757 7-03 Bowen Stele Corp. N/A 7-83 73 	02 Suiace Treatment &nes Ofeet 7 	e T 	T 	C Double -75,001 yents end greater SY $2.345 5 N/A N/A NIA NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 704 Ru1440 Standard Cap WA 784 7318102 &Am Treatment Seek. Oleld 7 - Surthe• ler Pelmet MoSSed Ceenle EmultMed NOW, Type C Double SY $0.200 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 

030000150757 7-Cl RUSSO Strldare Cep. 7.C1 7310102 &throe TreiMalart Singes 041546 7- 	e 	Type 01470* -0-25,000 yes SY $4.075 5 N/A NIA N/A WA N/A N/A NIA N/A 

COCC00150757 7.02 Ruse] Stele Cap NIA 7-02 7318102 Estate IreneSees Olatict 7- Estate Treatment. Type 0 Triple • 25.0011076.000 yertla SY $3.795 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A NIA N/A 

C00000150757 7.C3 Russell Stenland Cap NIA 7-03 7318102 Stele Treenent Santee 081540 7- Surface Treatment T 	01,46. • 75.001 yr& and rest: SY $33.675 5 N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 

000000150757 7-CA Busse Sherd Cap NIA 7-CA 7318102 Surface Treatment SerAces Peet 7- Surchne For Polymer Medfleel Ceonlc Emutalled Asphalt Type 0 Tele SY $0.350 5 N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA N/A 

000000150757 7411 Posta 506xli44 Corp WA 7-01 7318102 Ste. Treenem Services Peet 7 - Fog Seal - 0 - 25003 et SY $1.103 5 N/A WA N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A 

CO0000159757 7-02 Rouen Shade Corp N/A 7-02 7318102 Stec. Treatment Senecas Maki 7 - Fog Seel- 25.001 to 75.000 yes SY $1.100 5 N/A WA N/A NIA NIA NIA NIA NIA 

000030150757 7.03 Ruste/I Stintle CeICI. NIA 703 7318102 Surface 'Nal:meet Services 05100*17 - kg Seel. 75.001 ow% end 0reeer SY $1.100 5 N/A WA N/A WA NIA N/A NIA N/A 

000000150757 7-E1 Roue. Standard COM- N/A 741 73 8 02 Stew Inert Seniors Met 7 • MeIntainIn0 Title • PPM Truce and Ode Day 51.000 5 NIA NIA NIA N/A N/A N/A NIA NIA 

CO0000150757 70 Russell Strode Carp. N/A 70 7310102 Surface Trammell...1r*. Peel 7. MOnteirinp Traffic -Trete Centel Otoicee UNIT 50.300 5 N/A WA WA N/A WA N/A NIA NIA 

000000150757 743 Russel Startle Cap. NIA 7.E3 73113102 Stet. Treenent Slakes MHO 7- Ntelmteleinp Traffic - PLOW HOUR 555.000 5 N/A NIA WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

030000159757 744 Mosel Sande Corp. N/A 7-E4 7318102 Surface Treeneed Selma 00510 7 . MaInteing Trek -Arrow Board Day $20.000 5 N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 740 Roue% Standerd Cap. NIA 740 7318102 Surface Treenere Sera:ea 0681c1 7. MobIllzaton 050 P10.5 000 MILE 5500.000 5 N/A N/A NIA NIA NIA N/A N/A WA 
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000000159757 7-F2 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 7-F2 7318102 Surface TreatMent Services District 7. Mobilization for each Addifional Mile after Are first mile MILE $49.950 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 7-01 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 7-01 7310102 Surface Treatment Services District 7- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Barbour County TON $4.500 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 7-02 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 7-02 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 7- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Brarvtin County TON $22.500 5 N/A N/A al/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 7-03 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 7-03 7318102 Surface Treatment ServiceS Debt 7- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Gilmer County TON $31.750 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 7-04 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 7-04 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 7- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge- Lewis County TON $25.250 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 7-G5 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 7-05 7318102 Surface Treatment Services Ctistrict 7 ,  Aggregab Hauling Surcharge - Upshur County TON $6.050 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 7-08 Russell Standard Corp. WA 7-08 7318102 Surface Treatment Services Distdot 7- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Webster Count,  TON $22.750 5 N/A N/A NIA N/A WA N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 8-Al Russell Standard Corp NIA 8-Al 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 8 - Surface Peathlellir  Typos Single - 0 - 25.030 yards SY $1.550 5 WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 8-A2 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 0-A2 7318102 Surface Treatment Seru'icnn District 8 - Surface Treatment, Types Single - 25.001 - 75,000 yards SY $1450 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 8-A9 Russel/ Standard Corp. N/A 8-A3 7318102 Surface Treatment &latices Debbi 8 - Surface Treatrnent, Type B Single - 75,001 yards and greater SY $1.300 5 WA WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 8-A4 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8-A4 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 8 - Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt- Type 15 Single SY $0.120 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 8431 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8-131 7310102 Surface Treatment Se 	es District 8 - Surface Treabnent Type C Double - 0 - 25.000 yards SY $2.930 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 8432 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8432 7310102 Surface Treatment Services District 8 - Surface Treatment Type C Double .20,001 - 75.000 yards SY $2.700 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 8-53 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8-53 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District I. Surface Treatment Type C Double -75,001 yards and greater SY $2.560 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 8-514 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8434 7318102 Surface Treabnent Services District 8- Surcharge or Polymer Mudilod Cationic Emulsified Asphalt. Type C Double SY $0210 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 601 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8-01 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 8 - Surface Treatment. Type 0 Triple - 0 -20,000 yards SY $4.400 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 0-02 Russell Standard Corp. NIA 8-02 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 8 - Surface Treatment. Type D Triple -20,001 to 75,000 yards SY $4.130 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 8-C9 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 0-09 73113102 Surface Treatment Services District 8' Surface Treatnent. Type 0 Triple - 75,001 yards and greater SY 83.990 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 8-04 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8-C4 7218102 Surface Treatment Services District 8 - Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt, Type D Ingle SY $0.300 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 8-D1 Rune Standard Corp. N/A 8-D1 7918102 Surface Treatment Services District a- Cog Seal • 0 - 25,000 yards SY $0850 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 8-02 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 602 7318102 Surface Treabnect Services Distilot 0- Fog Seal - 25,001 to 70.000 yards SY $0800 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 8-03 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8-D3 7310102 Surface Treatment Services District 8 - Fog Seal • 75,001 yards and greater SY $0750 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 6E1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8-51 7318102 Surface Treatment Services Diskict 0 - Maintaining Traffic- Pilot Truck and Ddver Day $1.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 8-52 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 0-E2 7318102 Surface Treabnent Services District 0- Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices UNIT $0300 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A WA 

000000150757 8-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 8-53 7318102 Surface Treatment Services Dialric18 - Maintaining Traffic- Finger HOUR $55.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 8-E4 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8-54 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 8 - Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board Day $20.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
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000000159757 8-F1 Ruseell Standard Corp. N/A 8-F1 7316102 Surface Treatment Services Disbict 8- Mobil/us/on for First Mile MILE $500.000 5 WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 8-F2 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8-F2 731810.2 Surface Treatment Services District 8- Mobilization for each Additional Mile after the first mile MILE $49.950 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 8-G1 Russell Standard Corp ffillt 0-01 7318102 Surface Treatment Services Dishict 5- Aggregate  Hauling Surcharge . Pendleton County TON $14.500 5 N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 8-02 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8-02 7318102 surface Treatment Services District If - Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Pocahontas County TON $22.000 5 NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 8-03 Russell Standard Corp N/A 5-03 /315102 Surface Treatment Services District 8. Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Randolph CountY TON $4.250 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 8-04 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 8-04 7315102 Surface Treatment Services District 8- Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Tucker County TON $7.000 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 9-Al Russell Standard Corp. N/A 9-A1 7315102 Surface Treatment Services District 0- Outface Treatment Type El Single - 0 - 25.000 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000005isns7 0-02 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 942 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 0- Surface Treatment. Type B Single -25001- 75,000 yard, SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 0-A3 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 9-A3 7918102 Surface Treatment Services Dishict 0- Seam. Treatment. Type B Single - 75,501 yards and greater SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 9-A4 Russell Standard Corp N/A gt-Ad 7316102 Surface Treatment Services District 9 - Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt - Type El Single SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 0-01 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 9-81 7318102 Surface Treahnent Services Disbict 0 - Surbce Treatment Type C Double - 0 - 25,000 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

003000159757 9-82 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 9-02 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 0- Surface Treatment Type C Double - 25,001 -70,000 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 9-83 Russell Standard Corp, N/A 9-03 7318102 Surface Treatment Senices District 9 	a Treatment Type C Double - 75001 yards and greater SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 9-04 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 0-14 7318102 surface Treatment Services District 0- Surcharge for Polyrper Mod/ted Cationic Emulsified Asphalt. Type C Double SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 0-01 Russell Standard Corp N/A 9-01 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 9 - Surface Treatment, Type D Triple -0-20,000 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 0-02 Russell Standard Cory. N/A 9-02 731(1102 Surface Treatment Senices District 9 - Surface Treatment Type D Triple -25.001 to 75,000 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 0-03 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 0-03 7315102 Surface Treatment Senices District 0- Surface Treatment. Type D Triple -75,001 yards end greater BY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 9-04 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 9-04 73113102 Surface Treatment Services Dietict 0- Surcharge for Polymer Modified Cationic Emulsified Asphalt. Type 0 Triple BY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 9-D1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 9-D1 7318102 Surface Trealrnent Services DintiCt 5- Fog Seal - 0 - 25.000 yards BY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A WA N/A 

000000159757 9-D2 Russell standard Corp. NIA 0-D2 7318102 Surface Treabnent S 	e District 5- Fog Seal - 25.001 10 75,000 yards SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 0-03 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 9-03 7318102 Surface Treatrnent Services Dietrict 0- Fog Seal' 75.001 yards and greater BY No Bid 5 N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 9-E1 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 0-E1 7318102 Sudace Treatment Services District 5- Maintaining Traffic - Pilot Truck and Driver Day No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 0-E2 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 9-E2 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 9 - Maintaining Traffic - Traffic Control Devices UNIT No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 9-E9 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 9-03 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 0 - MaintaiNng Traffic - Flagger HOUR No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 9-E4 Russell Standard Corp N/A 0-14 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 9- Maintaining Traffic - Arrow Board Day No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 9-F1 RU-93011 standard Corp N/A 9-F1 7318102 Surface Treatment Services Dsbict 0- mobilization for First Mile MILE No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 
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000020150757 902 Russell Stand= Corp. N/A 0F2 7318102 Dud= Tmerrere Sent= Destid 0. MoblItagon Am et= AddMonal I= ater the first mge MILE No Bid 5 N/A NIA N/A N/A NIA N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 0.01 RussellStand= Corp. N/A 0431 7318102 Suit= Treatment Serve= Dietiet 0. A0040= =AN Suntherge • Fetete Coady TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000150757 9432 Rune. Stand= Corm NIA 002 7318102 =ate Tractile.* Santee Diarlet 9- Aggegele Remit= Stethewe • Greenbrier CountY TON No Bid 5 N/A NIA NIA NIA NIA WA NIA N/A 

000000150751 9.03 Rue= Slemdard Co.,, N/A 603 7318102 Stet= Treatmen1 Semi= Illetict 9. Amiegete Rearm Sun:Forge .140-4oe Comfy TON No Bid 5 NIA N/A N/A N/A WA NIA NIA N/A 

000000150757 0-04 Rulaell Stendard Cam N/A 004 3 8 02 Surface Treatment Senates COMM 0 - Aggegete Hauling Surcharge • NItholea County TON No Bid 5 NIA N/A WA N/A NIA NIA N/A N/A 

100000150757 005 Russel Sandard Corp. NIA 9-05 7318102 Sul= TreMmemt Semi= Mott 0 • AGIAmgete =Avg &recharge • Sun.= COOMY TON No Bid 5 NIA N/A WA N/A WA N/A N/A N/A 

=020150757 10-A1 Rona Sundstd Cow N/A 10-Al 7318102 Surface Treatment Stmloas (=Mt 10- Surface Treetment Type B UNA! • 0 .25,000 yrde SY No Bid 5 WA N/A WA N/A N/A N/A WA N/A 

000700150157 10-A2 Rune Standard Corp. NIA 1042 7310102 Sat= Treatment Sen.= DIM= 10 • Surf= treetment Typs B se* -15.009- 75,000 yards SY No Bld 5 WA N/A WA N/A WA N/A N/A N/A 

300000150757 lam ammo Sword Carp. NIA 1043 7310102 Surface Treatment Semi= =AM 10 . Sul= Trutt.= Type B Single • 75,001 yards and treatet SY No Bid 5 WA WA WA N/A N/A N/A WA N/A 

000000150757 10-A4 Russell Slanderd Corp, NIA 10-A4 7318102 Suffice  Tistotnad Senecas CittrIel 10- Syshinge for Potyrnet ModrIted CMS= EmulaMal =twit • Trott B SMON SY No Bid 5 WA N/A NIA NIA NIA N/A N/A WA 

000:00150751 10431 Pus= Stemlanl Corp. NIA 1001 7318102 Sul= Treatment Semi= Dishiel to-  Steams Trernment Typo C Double -0 - 25= weds SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A NIA 

000000150757 10-02 RIMINI Stended Corp. NIA 10432 1310102 Suttee Treatment Some= DOM 50- &at= Treatment Type C Double • 25.031- 75000 Ye= SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A NIA NIA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

ooc000l5O757 10-03 Rune' Stand= Cap. NIA 10433 7310102 Surface Treatment Santee Olatld to- Stet= Treetment Type C Cic•uble • 15001 weds and gm= SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A WA WA NIA 

=000150757 10-04 Russell Steraterd Corm NIA IONA 7310102 Sul= Tmetnent Senates Debiel 90- Surcharge 574 PelMitar tfoMfied Cateric Emtletted =het Type C Double SY No Bid 5 WA NIA WA NIA NIA NIA NIA NIA 

C00000150757 10-01 Ruse Stand= Cotp. NIA 10-C1 1310102 OrfaCe Treatment Service* Maid 10- Stabs. Treatment Typo 0 Ttle• 0 • 25000 ye/Is SY No Bid 5 N/A NIA NIA NIA NIA NIA N/A N/A 

000000150757 10-02 Rinse% Stand= Coop. N/A 10-02 7310102 Surface Tmatmatt Services Elistect 90- Stain. Treatment Type 0 Triple • 25.0010 75.000 ye= SY No Bid 5 WA N/A N/A NIA NIA WA NIA WA 

000000150757 10-03 Rut= Standen] Com. NM 0-03 7310102 Surface Treatment Stakes COMM 10- Stet= Treatment. Type 0 Id= • 75.001 =fa and greabm SY No Bid 5 NIA N/A N/A WA N/A WA N/A WA 

1001700150757 10-04 Rua= Stara= Oya NM 10-C4 7318102 Surface Tmatment Semites Dlette1 10 -Sum:Meg. no Polymer Meg= Ceionk Entulailled =1St Tyre ctume SY No Bid 5 NIA WA N/A WA N/A WA N/A WA 

100000150757 1001 FOnsall Staxlard Cap_ N/A 1001 7318102 Surface Tamen= Sate DiMid 10 -Fog Sea • 0.251703 =Os SY No Bid 5 NIA NIA NIA WA N/A WA N/A WA 

000=150757 10-02 Rune. StAININNCoop. NM 10-02 73 	02 Surf= vestment Services 01.040110 • Fog =1 • 25.0011.75.003 ywds SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A WA N/A WA N/A N/A 

000300159157 1003 Rteteell Stied.= Cap N/A 1003 7390102 =face traeller11SerAces Distid 10 • Fog SS • 78,001 'aids end =Met SY No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A 

ooco00159757 10-E1 Russel Stwelmd Corm N/A 1001 7318102 Smface Imam= Senecas Disttld 90- MaloWnIng Too/N- Pilot Truck end DrNer Day No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A WA NIA WA NIA WA 

00070015015/ 10-02 Ruud Slanderd Corp N/A 10-02 7310102 Sutme Mien= =Aces ON= 10 .1.1aintetrim Traffic . Traffic Colfrol Devices UNIT No Bid 5 N/A WA N/A N/A N/A WA WA N/A 

001000150757 10E3 Russel Stardard Cota NM 10E3 7318102 Surface Treeemed Serykes OMITICI 10. marmaikm Trek • Flaws/ HOUR No Bid 5 N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000=150757 10-E4 Rua= Meld= Corp. NIA 10-04 7310102 =tate Treatment ServIces Dletrld 10- It*Intotramp Trek - Am= Board Day No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A WA N/A NIA WA N/A 

000000159757 10F1 Russeg Sting= COW. N/A 1CAF I 7310102 Surface Trammel Service Olstriet 10 •711461Nratlat Ice First Mk MILE No Bid 5 NIA WA NIA NIA N/A NIA N/A N/A 
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000000159757 10-F2 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 10-F2 73113102 Surface Treatment Services District 10. Mobilization for each Additional Mile after the first mile MILE No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000155757 10-01 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 10-01 7118102 Surface Treatment Services Dish-13110 . Aggregate Hauling Surcharge • McDowell County TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000151757 10-02 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 10-02 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District no-Aggregate Hauling Sumter°, - Mercer Countv TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 10-03 Russell Standard Corp. N/A 10-01 7318102 Surface Treatment Senfices District 10 -Aggregate Hauling Surcharge - Raleigh County TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 

000000159757 10-04 Russell Standard Corp. A 10-00 7318102 Surface Treatment Services District 10 -Aggregate Hauling Surcharge 	ming County TON No Bid 5 N/A N/A N/A WA N/A N/A N/A N/A 
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